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An AmazIng 5 bedroom 5 bathroom luxurIous VIlla wIth guest apartmentLocated on the edge of CoIn 
close to AlhaurIn Golf Course.Just a 20 mInute drIve to the beaches at MIjas and FuengIrola. 25 mInutes to 
Marbella and Malaga aIrport.ThIs Immaculate VIlla has been constructed usIng the hIghest qualIty 
materIals, wIth attentIon to detaIl throughout for the current owners, IncorporatIng CavIty Insulated walls, 
Central heatIng and aIr-condItIonIng throughout.The property has been constructed across two plots to 
allow for extra outsIde usable space, surroundIng an InvItIng large swImmIng pool, buIlt specIfIcally to 
allow for regular use and exercIse.SItuated In a QuIet resIdentIal enclave of sImIlar qualIty propertIes 
offerIng a large communal pool area.Access Is vIa the pedestrIan gate or the large motorIzed double 
entrance gates, to a wIde ample drIveway wIth parkIng for numerous cars.The large double garage has 
been converted to be used as a prIvate busIness area and be converted back very easIly. ThIs Is tastefully 
furnIshed wIth extra wardrobe storage space.EnterIng the MaIn house through Its ImpressIve double 
entrance has you arrIvIng to a choIce of guest bathroom facIlItIes or a cleverly dIsguIsed entrance to the 
guest accommodatIon below. The beautIful brIght Lounge, whIch offers a choIce of heatIng and coolIng 
IncludIng, a log burnIng fIreplace, Central heatIng throughout or hot & cold AIr condItIonIng. ThIs open 
lounge gIves access to the maIn South facIng covered terrace area, wIth beautIful vIews over the pool. 
AccessIble from the lounge Is a full Bedroom en-suIte. Currently used as a formal dInIng room and the en-
suIte shower room converted to a study/offIce. All servIces are avaIlable to convert back to orIgInal use.To 
the other sIde of the lounge Is a second dInIng area whIch Is open plan to the InvItIng large famIly sIzed 
fully fItted kItchen, a further patIo area whIch has a covered BBQ area Is accessIble from the kItchen.From 
the lounge you can take the StaIrs leadIng up to the upper floor and Master suIte and great sIzed en-suIte 
luxury bathroom. A dressIng area wIth fItted wardrobes and access to a prIvate balcony overlookIng the 
pool vIa large brIght patIo doors. The Master suIte aIr-condItIonIng Is IndIvIdually controlled.The 
Separate three bedroom apartment can be accessed from the maIn house hallway or vIa prIvate external 
access and patIo, the apartment offers three luxury en-suIte bedrooms wIth Lounge/dInIng and KItchen, the 
hIghest standard of decor has been maIntaIned throughout gIvIng the feel of been consIstency throughout 
the VIlla.The Immaculate Gardens are easIly maIntaIned wIth the centerpIece beIng the superb twelve by 
sIx metre swImmIng pool. An external luxury shower room has been created, along wIth areas to relax on 
sun loungers, whIle sIppIng a cold glass of Cava enjoyIng the peace and tranquIlIty that has been created In 
the outdoor space. The Current owners have offered the accommodatIon & recreatIonal areas as a hIghly 
successful medItatIon and getaway retreat, gIvIng the new owner possIbIlItIes to generate a successful 
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Price: €585,000 
Bedrooms: 5
Bathrooms: 5
M2 Living: 2822

M2 Plot:  12112

M2 Terrace:  - 
Address:  CoIn,Malaga 



busIness as well.Detached VIlla, CoIn, Costa del Sol.5 Bedrooms, 5 Bathrooms, BuIlt 282 m2, Terrace 23 
m2, Garden/Plot 1211 m2.SettIng : Town, Suburban, Country, VIllage, Close To Golf, Close To Shops, 
Close To Town, Close To Schools, Close To Forest, UrbanIsatIon.OrIentatIon : South, South 
West.CondItIon : Excellent.Pool : PrIvate.ClImate Control : AIr CondItIonIng, Hot A/C, Cold A/C, Central 
HeatIng.VIews : MountaIn, Country, PanoramIc, Garden, Forest.Features : Covered Terrace, FItted 
Wardrobes, Near Transport, PrIvate Terrace, SatellIte TV, ADSL / WIFI, Guest Apartment, Guest House, 
Storage Room, UtIlIty Room, EnsuIte Bathroom, Marble FloorIng, Double GlazIng, Courtesy Bus, Staff 
AccommodatIon.KItchen : Fully FItted.Garden : PrIvate, Landscaped, Easy MaIntenance.SecurIty : Gated 
Complex, Entry Phone, Alarm System.ParkIng : Garage, Covered, PrIvate.UtIlItIes : ElectrIcIty, DrInkable 
Water, Telephone.Category : HolIday Homes, Investment, Luxury, Resale.

 


